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Based on the suspicion of pneumonia, sputum culture, 
Streptococcus pneumoniae and Legionella pneumophila uri-
nary antigens, blood cultures, urine culture and polymerase 
chain reaction for influenza A and B virus were performed. All 
results were negative except the sputum culture, which was 
positive after 24 hours. A pure culture of colonies with soft 
consistency was obtained and identified as Herbaspirillum hut-
tiense/H. aquaticum by MALDI-TOF analysis. The identification 
was subsequently confirmed by 16S rRNA gene sequencing, 
which showed 99% similarity with H. huttiense. Antibiotic 
sensitivity was assessed by using the microdilution method 
(MicroScan WalkAway, Siemens). The isolate was sensitive to 
gentamicin, tobramycin, amikacin, cefepime, ceftazidime, pip-
eracillin-tazobactam, ciprofloxacin, levofloxacin, trimethop-
rim-sulfamethoxazole and imipenem.

This case study deals with H. huttiense pneumonia in a 
patient with ET, and our interest focuses on two aspects that 
we want to highlight. First, Herbaspirillum identification is not 
included in the databases of commercial identification systems 
such as MicroScan or Vitek 2. In addition, this strain looks the 
same as strains from BCC. Consequently, the commercially 
available microbial identification systems may misidentify the 
organism [1-3,5]. This is mainly because Herbaspirillum species 
and BCC share a close phylogenetic relationship as do other 
non-fermenting rods such as Pseudomonas butanovora [6]. 
However, the Herbaspirillum species show a different profile of 
antimicrobial susceptibility with respect to BCC, with the latter 
exhibiting higher resistance profiles. Therefore, when a bacteri-
um is identified as BCC but is sensitive to all or most antibiotics, 
misidentification should be suspected in this microorganism. 
Currently, identification at the genus level is achieved through 
MALDI-TOF analysis; however, distinguishing H. huttiense and 
H. aquaticum species requires sequence-based identification of 
the 16S rRNA gene.

Second, in the context of pneumonia, the clinical sig-
nificance deserves special attention. To our knowledge, Her-
baspirillum species have only been isolated from respiratory 

Sir,

Herbaspirillum infection is a very rare cause of pneumo-
nia. Although a few cases of Herbaspirillum infections in hu-
mans have been described [1-4], one only case of infection in a 
non-immunocompromised host has been reported [2].

The identification of this aetiology is clinically relevant. 
This strain appears identical to strains from Burkholderia ce-
pacia complex (BCC), which are pathogens with different re-
sistance profiles and different therapeutic implications. Thus, 
conventional identification methods cannot be used to identify 
Herbaspirillum [1-3,5], which may explain why it is so seldom 
described and perhaps often misidentified. It is expected that 
new methods of bacterial characterization (i.e., MALDI-TOF 
mass spectrometry) will enable the identification of this mi-
croorganism in clinical samples. To this end, it is necessary to 
be aware of the infection frequency and clinical characteristics. 
We present a new case of Herbaspirillum pneumonia, in a hos-
pitalized patient suffering from essential thrombocythaemia 
(ET) but without evident immunocompromise.

A 59-year-old woman with deterioration of general con-
dition presented with extensive aortic wall thrombosis and vis-
ceral and cerebral ischaemic lesions, establishing the diagnosis 
of JAK2+ essential thrombocythaemia and new onset diabetes 
mellitus. Anti-coagulant treatment was established, with pro-
gressive reduction of the aortic mural thrombus. Therefore, 
surgical treatment was ruled out. Upon admission, the patient 
presented no respiratory symptoms. After 10 days, she present-
ed with dyspnoea, pulmonary infiltration and febrile syndrome, 
consistent with nosocomial pneumonia. The patient received 
empirical treatment with piperacillin-tazobactam and recovered 
completely once she had completed a cycle of antibiotic therapy.
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samples of patients with cystic fibrosis, and its role is doubtful 
[7]. There is only one reported case of pneumonia with bacter-
aemia caused by H. aquaticum/H. huttiense in an immunocom-
petent adult [2]. Conversely, most infections have been report-
ed in immunocompromised hosts [1], particularly those who 
have undergone haematopoietic stem cell transplant [3]. In our 
search of the available literature, we found no documented 
cases of Herbaspirillum pneumonia without bloodstream in-
fections. There is one reported case of bacteraemia secondary 
to pneumonia in a patient with multiple myeloma [4] and one 
case of sepsis and pneumonia in a patient with lung cancer [1].

We find this case to be of interest because it describes a 
case of pneumonia caused by H. huttiense in a patient with 
ET, which is an uncommon myeloproliferative disorder. Fur-
ther longitudinal studies are needed to establish whether the 
Herbaspirillum isolate obtained from cultures of sputum cor-
respond to transient colonization or chronic infection. In addi-
tion, although there are currently only a limited number of re-
ported cases, it is likely that new identification methods could 
facilitate its identification and lead to further cases of infection 
being recognized. In any case, immunocompromised patients 
colonized by opportunistic pathogens in the upper airway are 
at higher risk of pneumonia. Therefore, we emphasize the im-
portance of including accurate identification systems such as 
MALDI-TOF and/or molecular techniques in diagnostic labora-
tories to improve the reliability of Herbaspirillum identifica-
tion and to differentiate phylogenetic relatives. Such detailed 
levels of analysis should both enable appropriate treatment to 
be provided and establish the true prevalence of this potential 
opportunistic pathogen in human hosts.
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